Carrollton-Farmers Branch
Independent School District
Executive Summary Report

Date District Objective Agenda Item #

August 4, 2011 Objective 3 — Continuously increase operational effectiveness [11.B.10

Agenda Item: Consider RFP #11-05-053-0 Grounds — Lawn Chemicals

Summary:

This is a defined service contract which provides for the purchase of Lawn Chemicals required by the
Grounds Department. This is a one-year contract with no extension options. Prices are firm for one year
from date of award.

An estimate of the annual spending under this contract is $102,480.23. This figure is based upon the
District's estimated annual required quantity multiplied by the awarded unit prices.

Nineteen vendors received this proposal. Nine vendors submitted proposals. One proposal was
incomplete/non-compliant and was not considered. Another vendor withdrew their bid submission from
consideration.

It is recommended that this contract be awarded to the five vendors listed below.

BWI

John Deere

Pioneer

Tomlinson Ballfield Materials
Winfield Solutions

Attachments:

Tabulation

Administrative Recommendation:

Administration recommends award of this contract to the vendors listed above.

Budget/Funding

General Operating Budget




RFP # 11-05-053-0 Lawn Chemicals

Estimated Yearly

# Usage Manufacturer Description BWiI Excel John Justin Pioneer | Winfield | Tomlinson Extgnded
- Garden Deere Seed Prices
Quantities
ITEMS 1 - 8 - FOR GROUNDS MAINTENANCE DEPARTMENT (alternate products accepted)
300 Bags Houactinite (Fairway Grade)
1 (7.5 Tor?s) BCF Products [6-3-0 $ 6.38| No Bid No Bid NoBid| NoBid | $ 6.35 No Bid 1,905.00
' (50 Lb Bags)
. 21-0-0 Fertilizer APF w/2%
o | 1000Bags jAmerican Plant) ' " e i Grade) $ 1129 $ 10.69|$ 14.20|$ 5.37| NoBid | $ 10.50 | No Bid 10,500.00
(25 Tons) Food Corp. (50 Lb Bags)
480 Bads 15-5-10 Fertilizer FE W/2%
3 (12 Tongs) BCF Products [lron $ 1253 NoBid |[$ 14.75| $12.14| NoBid | $ 12.45| NoBid 5,976.00
(50 Lb Bags)
Zero Ice Pet-Guard
4| 400Bags Howard = 1o e ) $ 491| NoBid | NoBid | $11.16| NoBid | NoBid | No Bid 1,964.00
(4 Tons) Johnsons (20 Lb Bags)
80 Bags .
5| (2 Pallets of 40 ronite | ronite Pro #25 $ 12.94| $ 12.19| NoBid | NoBid| NoBid | NoBid | No Bid 1,035.20
(40 Lb Bags)
bags)
120 Bags Plus 5 Field Marker . . .
6 (3 Tons) IMERYS (50 Lb Bags) $ 4771 $ 4.72| NoBid NoBid| $ 9.25| $ 4.95 No Bid 572.40
400 Each no Vinyl Acrylic Latex Field
7 (2000 gallons) manufacturer |Marking Paint (White) $ 43.43| NoBid | $ 29.50| NoBid| $ 37.75( $ 37.95| No Bid 15,100.00
9 preferred  [(5 gallon container)
100 Bales Sun Gro Peat Moss . . . . .
8 (380 cu ) Sunshine  |(3.8 cubit foot bales) $ 1147 $ 9.75| NoBid | NoBid| NoBid | No Bid No Bid 1,147.00
ITEMS 9-26 - FOR GENERAL MAINTENANCE DEPARTMENT (alternate products NOT accepted)
Pendulum AquaCap
o| l0cCases Basp  |(Pre-Emergentforur) ¢ 56, 69| NoBid | $ 426.00| NoBid | NoBid | $295.75| No Bid 2,646.90
(50 gallons) (2.5 gallon jug X 2 jugs per
case)
20 Bags Award Fire Ant Bait . . . .
11 (500 1bs.) Syngenta (25 Lb Bags) $ 20537 NoBid | $ 267.75| NoBid | NoBid | $215.00| No Bid 4,107.40
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RFP # 11-05-053-0 Lawn Chemicals

Estimated Yearly
# Usage Manufacturer Description BWI Excel John Justin Pioneer | Winfield | Tomlinson Extgnded
- Garden Deere Seed Prices
Quantities
40 Bags Extinguish Plus Fire Ant
12 Zoecon Killer $ 155.55| $162.00( NoBid | NoBid| NoBid | $175.60( NoBid | $ 6,222.00
(2000 Ibs.)
(25 Lb. Bags)
13 é%OBlabf) BASF (Azrgdl_rg ggss?m Bait $ 167.22| $152.35| NoBid | NoBid| NoBid | $190.00| NoBid | $ 3,344.40
14 (128036;8:.) Bayer (Tsoopl_%hg:ges;”secnc'de $ 162.50| NoBid | $ 162.50| NoBid| NoBid | $162.50| NoBid | $ 3,250.00
Round-Up Pro Con
15 (518 gcaj‘;iss) Scotts Ortho g_zrzz'gi)jug X2jugsper | & 9577| NoBid | $ 7890 NoBid| NoBid | $ 8290| NoBid |$  789.00
case)
Round-Up Pro 1.T.O 7
16 (7155 gca?lfﬁfs) Scotts Ortho g_zrz:l'gi)jug X2jugsper | § 5471 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid| NoBid | § 8290| NoBid |$ 82065
case)
40 Cases Sahara DG (Herbicide) . . _ _ _
17 (1600 Ibs) BASF (10 Ib. container X 4 $ 458.22| NoBid No Bid | NoBid| NoBid | $500.00| NoBid | $ 18,328.80
' container per case)
7 Cases Quick Pro (HerbiciFJe) . . . .
19 (35 gallons) Monsanto [(2.5 gallon jug X 2 jugs per | $ 247.00f NoBid | $ 338.00| NoBid| NoBid [ $260.00| NoBid | $ 1,729.00
case)
Aquamaster (Aquatic
20 (122 gzlslsrfs) Monsanto '(*Ze;bg;ﬁg% jug X 2 jugs per | & 101:05| No Bid Alt | NoBid| NoBid | $ 98.00| NoBid |$ 1,240.25
case)
10 Cases Speedzone_ (Herb_icide) _ _ _ _ _
21 (50 gallons) PBI / Gordon |(2.5 gallon jug X 2 jugs per No Bid No Bid | $ 358.00( NoBid| NoBid | $287.50( NoBid | $ 2,875.00
case)
5 Cases Cool Power_ (Herb_icide) _ _ _ _ _
22 (25 gallons) Nufarm (2.5 g);allon jug X 2jugsper | $ 248.05| No Bid NoBid | NoBid| NoBid | $266.00f NoBid | $ 2,480.50
case
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RFP # 11-05-053-0 Lawn Chemicals

Estimated Yearly
# Usage Manufacturer Description BWiI Excel John Justin Pioneer | Winfield | Tomlinson Extgnded
- Garden Deere Seed Prices
Quantities
1 Case Fusilade
23 syngenta  [( 1 quart bottle X 8 bottles | $ 56.26| NoBid | $ 83.00| NoBid| NoBid [ $472.00| NoBid | $ 450.08
(8Qts)
per case).
. - Blazon Spray Pattern
p4| 5 Containers | Milliken Turf | vonior Blue) $ 94.44| No Bid At | NoBid| NoBid | $ 58.00] NoBid [$  290.00
(12.5 gallons) Products .
(2.5 gallon container)
6 Cases Becker Turf Mark Blue
25 (24 gallons) Underwood (1 gallon jug X 4 jugs per $ 129.65| NoBid NoBid | NoBid| NoBid [ No Bid NoBid | $ 777.90
case)
35 Cases Becker Turf Mark Green
26 (175 gallons) Underwood gi.feg)]allon jug X2jugsper | $ 172.25| No Bid No Bid | NoBid| NoBid | $210.00| NoBid | $ 6,028.75
ITEMS 27-29 - BALL FIELD MATERIALS
Diamond Pro Infield
07| 200Bags X Conditioner $ 639 NoBid | $ 1210 NoBid | NoBid | Nogid | %0 |'s 220000
(5 tons) Diamond Pro bag
(50 Lb Bags)
200 Bads Pitcher's Mound Clay
28 9 (screened) $ 7951 $ 835|% 16.62| NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | $6.50Bag| $ 1,300.00
(5 tons)
(50 Lb Bags)
6 Loads Infield Dirt . . . . . $900.00
29 (150 cubic yards) (25 cubic yards per Load) $1,467.65| No Bid No Bid | NoBid | No Bid | No Bid renllee $ 5,400.00
NP = non-compliant product or package size Prices shown in BLUE are alternate products $ 102,480.23
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