Carrollton-Farmers Branch
Independent School District
Executive Summary Report

Date District Objective Agenda ltem #

August 4, 2011 Objective 1 — Continuously increase student achievement 11.B.11

Agenda Item: Consider RFP #11-06-081-2 for Printing Services

Summary:

This is an as needed contract which provides for the purchase of various custom printing materials.
Spending for this category was $160,204.41 between June 2010 and May 2011 which indicates the need
for this new RFP. Two one-year extension options are allowed under the provisions of this RFP.

Proposals were solicited from 34 vendors; responses were received from 8 vendors.

The recommended vendors are listed below.

American Solutions for Business
Greater Dallas Press

Johnson Printing Service
Marfield Corporate Stationery
P&E Printing

Print Tex Graphics

Quick Draw Printing

Red Roof Printing Services

Attachments:

Tabulation

Administrative Recommendation:

Administration recommends award of this contract to the vendors listed above.

Budget/Funding

General Operating Budget




American

Marfield

Yellow - primary award ) Greater Dallas |Johnson Printing - Print Tex Qick Draw Red Roof
Solutions for Press Service Corporate P&E Printing Graphics Printin Printing Services
Orange - secondary award Business Stationery p 9 9
No. Estimated Quantity Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 |Two-part NCR forms, 8-1/2" X 5-1/4" $ 259.75] lot No Bid $ 229.00]| lot No Bid $ 310.00]| lot | $ 380.00| lot | $ 270.00| lot| $ 125.00]| lot
2 |Two-part NCR forms, 8-1/2" X 11" $ 310.00| lot No Bid $ 416.00| lot No Bid $ 600.00]| lot| $ 489.90| lot | $ 354.00| lot | $ 450.00]| lot
3 |Two-part NCR forms, 8-1/2" X 14" $ 337.00] lot No Bid $ 683.00] lot No Bid $ 650.00]| lot| $ 565.50| lot | $ 460.00| lot | $ 500.00]| lot
4 |Three-part NCR forms, 5" X 3" $ 244.25] lot No Bid $ 202.00] lot No Bid $ 260.00]| lot | $ 388.00| lot | $ 192.00| lot | $ 200.00| lot
5 |Three-part NCR forms, 8-1/2" X 5-1/2" $ 349.50] lot No Bid $ 357.00] lot No Bid $ 410.00]| lot | $ 500.40] lot | $ 375.00| lot | $ 325.00]| lot
6 |Three-part NCR forms, 8-1/2"X 11" $ 432.50| lot No Bid $ 682.00| lot No Bid $ 700.00| lot| $ 654.75]| lot| $ 577.00| lot | $ 600.00]| lot
7 |Four-part NCR forms, 6" X 4 1/4" $ 406.00] lot No Bid $ 388.00]| lot No Bid $ 310.00| lot | $ 510.15] lot | $ 350.00| lot | $ 300.00]| lot
8 |Four-part NCR forms, 8-1/2" X 11" $ 552.00| lot No Bid $ 956.00| lot No Bid $ 800.00| lot| $ 781.05| lot| $ 829.00| lot | $ 800.00]| lot
9 |[Five-part NCR forms, 8-1/2" X 11" $ 743.25] lot No Bid $1,598.00| lot No Bid $1,325.00| lot | $ 940.05( lot | $1,000.00( lot | $1,100.00| lot
10 |ENVELOPES-500/box 5-11/16" X 4-3/8", A2 size, tan paper, 3| ¢ 137 og | pox No Bid No Bid |box No Bid Callfor 1pox| NoBid [box| NoBid |box|$ 99.00|box
color printing w/ logo on front side, 1 color printing on back. quote
11 ENVELOPES-500/box 6-1/2" X 4-3/4", A6 size, white paper, 3| ¢ 155 05| pox|  No Bid NoBid [box|  NoBid Callfor 1pox| NoBid [box| NoBid |box|$ 99.00|box
color printing w/ logo on front side, 1 color printing on back. quote
12 |ENVELOPES-500/box #10 windown envelope wi return $ 1364|box| NoBid |$ 2191|box| NoBid |$ 2650[box| NoBid |box| $ 16.46 $  34.00|box
service requested under printed return address. Black Ink box
13 |ENVELOPES-500/box # 9 white self-addressed insert $ 1420|box| NoBid |$ 2091|box| NoBid |$ 2550|[box| NoBid |box|$ 17.27 $  29.00|box
envelopes, Black Ink. box
14 |ENVELOPES-500/box P.O. window #10 osds/white standard | ¢ g gg|pox|  No Bid NoBid |box| NoBid |$ 3450{box| NoBid |box|$ 18.99 $  39.00|box
poly window 24 ww, inside tint. Black ink. box
ENVELOPES-500/box #10 white, regular #24 diagonal seam,
15 |white woven virgin paper, Printed w/ logo & Admin. address, $ 2.50 | box No Bid No Bid | box No Bid $ 59.00| box No Bid |box| $ 20.62 box $  34.00 | box
colors red & taupe.
ENVELOPES-500/box #10 white, regular #24 diagonal seam,
white woven virgin paper, Printed w/ logo & School/Dept. $ 67.00]| box No Bid No Bid | box No Bid $ 59.00 | box No Bid | box No Bid |box| $ 34.00 | box
16 |address, colors red & taupe.
ENVELOPES-50/pkg. Report card envelope. 6.5 X 9.5, open
17 |end, no glue on flap, #28 brown kraft. Printed on one side, $ 8.33| pkg No Bid No Bid | pkg No Bid $ 8.50 | pkg No Bid | pkg| $ 5.26 | pkg| $ 6.50 | pkg
Black Ink.
Business Cards, White (horizontal/vertical Style) Printed per
18 |district specifications. Apple logo & printed in Red &Taupe ink.| $  36.75| box No Bid No Bid | box 30.80|box| $ 58.00|box| NoBid |box| $ 32.00|{box| $ 19.00|box
500/box #1 Bright white cougar.
19 |Benchmark Testing Booklets Yes Yes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 |Gold Embossed Seals No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Yes No Bid No Bid
21 |Self Inking Stamps No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Yes Yes Yes No Bid
22 |Rubber Stamps No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Yes Yes Yes No Bid
23 |Fire Extinguisher Tags No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Yes Yes Yes No Bid
24 |Parking Hang Tags No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Yes Yes Yes No Bid
25 |Can your firm offer free delivery? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
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